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Editorial

Large linguistically interpreted corpora continue to play an important role for machine learning, eval-
uation, psycholinguistics, and (increasingly so) theoretical linguistics. Research groups world-wide
are engaged in the creation of corpus resources annotated with morphological, syntactic, semantic,
and discourse information for an ever-increasing variety of languages. Since 1999, the LINC work-
shop series has brought together these activities in order to identify and disseminate best practice in
the development and utilization of linguistically interpreted corpora. LINC workshops, thus, have
traditionally served a dual purpose, viz. to (i) present an up-to-date survey of ongoing work on lin-
guistically interpreted corpora and (ii) facilitate the exchange, propagation, and further development
of research results with respect to the annotation, conversion, and exploitation of such corpora. We
hope to continue this tradition at LINC-05, as a post-conference workshop at IJCNLP on beautiful
Jeju Island.

The aim of the workshop is to exchange and propagate research results with respect to the annota-
tion, conversion and exploitation of corpora taking into account different applications and theoretical
investigations in the field of language technology and research. The call for papers encouraged sub-
missions of papers constituting substantial, original, and unpublished work on all aspects of linguis-
tically interpreted corpora, including, but not limited to: (a) creation of practical annotation schemes,
(b) efficient annotation techniques, (c) automation of corpus annotation, (d) tools supporting cor-
pus conversions, (e) validation including consistency checking of corpora, (f) browsing corpora and
searching for instances of linguistic phenomena, (g) interpretation of quantitative results, and (h) au-
tomatic induction of linguistic competence through machine learning techniques. Looking at the final
program for the workshop, we believe all of the above are represented at LINC-05.

We would like to thank all the authors who submitted papers. There were 14 submissions, of
which 11 appear in the proceedings. We would like to particularly thank all the members of the
program committee for their time and effort in ensuring that all submissions were fairly assessed.

Finally, we wish to thank the organizers of the main conference, in particular the conference
workshop co-chairs, Yuji Matsumoto and Laurent Romary,
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Kyonghee Paik,
Francis Bond, and

Stephan Oepen
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