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Preface

The LaTeCH (Language Technology for Cultural Heritage, Social Sciences, and Humanities) annual
workshop series aims to provide a forum for researchers working on aspects of natural language and
information technology applications that pertain to data from the humanities, social sciences, and cultural
heritage. The LaTeCH workshop series, which started in 2007, was initially motivated by the growing
interest in language technology research and applications to the cultural heritage domain. The scope
quickly broadened to also include the humanities and the social sciences.

Advances in information technology and web access of the past decade have triggered a multitude of
digitisation efforts by museums, archives, libraries and other cultural heritage institutions. Similar
developments in the humanities and social sciences have resulted in large amounts of research data
becoming available in electronic format, either as digitised or as born-digital data. The natural follow-up
step to digitisation is the intelligent processing of this data. To this end, the humanities, social sciences,
and cultural heritage domains draw an increasing interest from researchers in NLP aiming at developing
methods for semantic enrichment and information discovery and access. Language technology has been
conventionally focused on certain domains, such as newswire. These fairly novel domains of cultural
heritage, social sciences, and humanities entail new challenges to NLP research, such as noisy text (e.g.,
due to OCR problems), non-standard, or archaic language varieties (e.g., historic language, dialects,
mixed use of languages, ellipsis, transcription errors), literary or figurative writing style and lack of
knowledge resources, such as dictionaries. Furthermore, often neither annotated domain data is available,
nor the required funds to manually create it, thus forcing researchers to investigate (semi-) automatic
resource development and domain adaptation approaches involving the least possible manual effort.

In the current sixth edition of the LaTeCH workshop we have again received a record number of
submissions, a subset of which has been selected based on a thorough peer-review process. The
submissions were substantial not only in terms of quantity, but also in terms of quality and variety,
underlining the increasing interest of NLP and CL researchers in in this exciting and expanding research
area. A central issue for a substantial part of the contributions to this LaTeCH workshop is the
development of corpora, lexical resources and annotation tools for historical language varieties. Some
contributions focus on two other recurrent issues, namely the description and classification of cultural
heritage objects and the problems related to noisy and handwritten text. Most importantly, the research
presented in this edition of the LaTeCH workshop showcases the breadth of interest in applications of
language technologies to a variety of social sciences and e-humanities domains, ranging from history to
ethnography and from philosophy to literature and historical linguistics.

We would like to thank all authors for the hard work that went into their submissions. We are also
grateful to the members of the programme committee for their thorough reviews, and to the EACL 2012
organisers, especially the Workshop Co-chairs, Kristiina Jokinen and Alessandro Moschitti for their help
with administrative matters.

Kalliopi Zervanou and Antal van den Bosch
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Manex Agirrezabal, Iñaki Alegria, Bertol Arrieta and Mans Hulden . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 13

Toward Language Independent Methodology for Generating Artwork Descriptions – Exploring
FrameNet Information
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